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Alerts

1 event
50 results matching for 'Complete Applications Filed' during November 2007.

Number Title Date
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2007231678 An aqueous dispersion and its use for the anti-mould treatment of rinded chesses 14 Nov 2007

2007231686 Boat roof, in particular yacht roof, and boat 14 Nov 2007

2007231660 Gaming console and system having dynamic feature game 14 Nov 2007

2007231683 Gaming machine and gaming method thereof 14 Nov 2007

2007231685 Gaming machine and gaming method thereof 14 Nov 2007

2007231693 Process for the production of stable polymers 14 Nov 2007

2007231662 A blast plug 14 Nov 2007

2007231691 Expression of biologically active polypeptides in duckweed 14 Nov 2007

2007231675 Cell reprogramming (2) 14 Nov 2007

2007231666 Slide board bag 14 Nov 2007

2007231687 Ganglioside-associated recombinant antibodies and the use thereof in the diagnosis and
treatment of tumors

14 Nov 2007

2007231649 Open-close mode and device for bottom discharging door 14 Nov 2007

2007231677 Adjuvanted meningococcus compositions 14 Nov 2007

2007231673 Advances to temperature profiling polyalcohol, combustion speed modifying fuel additive. 14 Nov 2007

2007231697 User-configurable interface for a cooking appliance 14 Nov 2007

2007231670 Safe search method and apparatus 14 Nov 2007

2007231695 Methods and systems to increase efficiency and reduce fouling in coal-fired power plants 14 Nov 2007

2007231651 Defibrotide and/or oligodeoxyribonucleotides for treating angiogenesis-dependent tumors 14 Nov 2007

2007231681 Peripheral-type benzodiazepine receptor associated proteins, cloning, expression and
methods of use

14 Nov 2007

2007231667 A method of implementing antipassback control in a partially connected physical access
control system

14 Nov 2007

2007231652 Guards for Protecting Guttering 14 Nov 2007

2007231688 Cable integrity monitor for electromagnetic telemetry systems 14 Nov 2007

2007231650 Intelliheat automatic hot water circulation controller 14 Nov 2007

2007231661 Slicer 14 Nov 2007

2007231676 Method and apparatus for calibrating electrochemical sensors 14 Nov 2007

2007231692 Hepatitis C virus vaccine 14 Nov 2007

2007231680 Shower Timer 14 Nov 2007

2007231694 Intellectual thought 14 Nov 2007

2007231630 Electronic ballast 14 Nov 2007

2007231659 A Monitoring System for Television Screen Advertising 14 Nov 2007

2007231696 Vessel 14 Nov 2007

2007231671 Personalization of self-checkout security 14 Nov 2007

2007231672 System and method for interpreting a specification language file to implement a business
system

14 Nov 2007

2007231674 Weight scale fault detection 14 Nov 2007

2007231665 Bed assembly 14 Nov 2007

2007231663 A pipe fitting 14 Nov 2007

2007231664 A pipe coupling arrangement and a pipe fitting including the pipe coupling arrangement 14 Nov 2007
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2007231668 Vertical Timber Laminates 14 Nov 2007

2007231682 Cyclopropene compositions 14 Nov 2007

2007231690 SS450L slimline 14 Nov 2007

2007231653 Multi-Angle Laser Scanner 14 Nov 2007

2007231654 Transparant conveyor for check-out scanning 14 Nov 2007

2007231655 Laser scanner using acousto-optic deflectors 14 Nov 2007

2007231656 Handheld laser scanner 14 Nov 2007

2007231657 Hand-wearable coded data reader 14 Nov 2007

2007231658 Handheld coded data reader 14 Nov 2007

2007231679 Antimicrobial medical devices 14 Nov 2007

2007231684 Novel tumor-associated marker 14 Nov 2007

2007231689 Surgical stapling instruments including a cartridge having multiple staple sizes 14 Nov 2007

2007231669 Improved Polymer Encapsulation for Medical Device 14 Nov 2007
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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